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Spitfire DC Ceiling Fan
By Fanimation

COUNTRY OF ORIGIN . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . China

BULB . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . N/A

DIMENSIONS . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 64"W x 19.69"H

DIMMER . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . N/A

WATTAGE . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . N/A

BODY FINISH . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . Brushed Nickel

BLADE COLOR . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . Brushed Nickel

Specifications

Description

The quiet, energy-efficient Spitfire DC Ceiling Fan
delivers powerful airflow to freshen up your indoor
or covered outdoor space. With a streamlined
profile and wide selection of attractive finishes for
the motor and blades, it integrates well into any
room design. The fan is available with or without
an integrated LED light kit. The light is diffused
through a fresnel lens or frosted polycarbonate
lens (both included), providing ambient
illumination. CCT (color temperature) can be
adjusted to 3000K, 4000K, or 5000K using the
remote control or smart device app. A WiFi hand-
held remote control (TR305) is included and can
turn the motor on/off, set 16 speeds, forward and
reverse, breeze mode, and timers. If the fan has a
light, the remote turns it on/off, dims, and adjusts
the color temperature. The Spitfire DC can also be
controlled through the fanSync WiFi app on your
smart device, or through smart home systems
including Amazon Echo/Alexa, Google Home, Nest
and ecobee for a truly modern experience.
Optional accessories are sold separately.

Shown in brushed nickel / brushed nickel
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