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Logico Single Wall Light
By Artemide

COUNTRY OF ORIGIN . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . Italy

OTHER BULB OPTIONS . . . . . . . . . . . . . 2 x A19/Medium (E26)/120V LED

BULB NOT INCLUDED . . . . . . . 2 x A19/Medium (E26)/75W/120V Incandescent

DIMENSIONS . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 15"W x 12.25"H x 7.25"D

DIMMER . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . Standard 120V

WATTAGE . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 150W

BODY FINISH . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . Gray

COLOR . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . White

Specifications

Description

Introduce a touch of organic elegance to your
walls with the Logico Single Wall Light, a fixture
that redefines how light interacts with space. This
exquisite sconce features a hand-blown,
organically shaped satin glass diffuser that creates
a mesmerizing illusion, appearing to float
effortlessly and casting a soft, inviting glow.
Available in timeless Milky White, the glass is
beautifully contrasted by a sturdy die-cast frame
in a pale Grey finish, ensuring a sleek and
integrated appearance against your wall. The
Logico Single Wall Light is UL listed for safety and
proudly made in Italy, a testament to its superior
craftsmanship and enduring design. Customers
frequently highlight its unique sculptural form
and beautiful ambient light, praising its ability to
add depth and sophistication to any room. Perfect
for hallways, living rooms, bedrooms, or dining
areas, this fixture offers an architectural and
contemporary aesthetic, transforming your walls
into canvases of light and shadow with its subtle
yet impactful presence.

Shown in gray / white

CLICK TO VIEW PRODUCT

Notes:
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