
lightology.com
866-954-4489

09-14-25

Project:

Company:

Location: Fixture Type:

SPEC #: ART2801

Approved On: Approved By:

Logico Micro Single Ceiling Mount
By Artemide

COUNTRY OF ORIGIN . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . Italy

BULB NOT INCLUDED . . . . . 1 x G16.5/Candelabra (E12)/60W/120V Incandescent

DIMENSIONS . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 7"W x 7.5"H

DIMMER . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . Standard 120V

WATTAGE . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 60W

BODY FINISH . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . Gray

COLOR . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . White

Specifications

Description

Introduce a touch of delicate artistry to your ceiling
with the Logico Micro Single Ceiling Mount. This
charming fixture features a hand-blown,
organically shaped satin glass diffuser that creates
a mesmerizing illusion, appearing to float
weightlessly and casting a beautiful, diffused light.
Available in timeless Milky White, the glass is
elegantly framed by a die-cast aluminum frame
with a pale grey finish, ensuring a seamless and
refined integration with your ceiling. The Logico
Micro Single is incredibly versatile, designed for
applications as a single unit to create an intimate
pool of light, or as part of a larger assembly of three
units in a nested or linear configuration for a more
expansive design. UL listed for safety and proudly
made in Italy, this fixture reflects exceptional
craftsmanship. Customers appreciate its subtle
elegance and perfect size for small spaces or
accent lighting. Ideal for hallways, bathrooms, or
creating a series of individual light points in a
larger room, this contemporary ceiling mount
offers both aesthetic grace and functional
brilliance.

Shown in gray / white

CLICK TO VIEW PRODUCT

Notes:
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