
lightology.com
866-954-4489

08-21-25

Project:

Company:

Location: Fixture Type:

SPEC #: ART476534

Approved On: Approved By:

Tolomeo Shade Wall Light Plug In
By Artemide

COUNTRY OF ORIGIN . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . Italy

BULB NOT INCLUDED . . . . . . . 1 x A19/Medium (E26)/53W/120V Incandescent

DIMENSIONS . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 7.25"W x 26"H x 26.75"D

DIMMER . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . Not Dimmable

WATTAGE . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 53W

BODY FINISH . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . Aluminum

COLOR . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . Parchment Paper

Specifications

Description

The Tolomeo Shade Wall Light Plug In brings the
iconic design and renowned flexibility of the
Tolomeo series directly to your wall, offering
versatile illumination without the need for
complex wiring. This elegant fixture features a
classic shade, available in either warm Parchment
or sophisticated Grey Fiber, perfectly
complemented by its refined aluminum finish.
Designed for effortless installation, an S-bracket is
conveniently included, allowing for easy plug-in
setup. This feature makes it an ideal choice for
renters or those seeking adaptable lighting
solutions. Despite its simple installation, it
maintains the superior adjustability Tolomeo is
known for, allowing you to direct light precisely
where needed.The lamp requires one 75-watt
max 120-volt medium base bulb (not included),
giving you the freedom to customize your light
source. This wall light is perfect for illuminating a
reading nook, a desk, or adding an artistic touch
to any wall space with its functional elegance.

Shown in aluminum / parchment paper

CLICK TO VIEW PRODUCT

Notes:
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